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Examine the approach to the interpretation of the Convention on the Elimination of All Forms 

of Discrimination against Women adopted in General Recommendation nr 28 by CEDAW (see 

below!) What methods of interpretation does CEDAW propose? Do you agree or disagree, and 

why?  

[EXTRACT] CONVENTION ON THE ELIMINATION OF ALL FORMS OF DISCRIMINATION AGAINST 

WOMEN 

 

The States Parties to the present Convention, 

Noting that the Charter of the United Nations reaffirms faith in fundamental human rights, in the dignity and 
worth of the human person and in the equal rights of men and women,  

Noting that the Universal Declaration of Human Rights affirms the principle of the inadmissibility of 
discrimination and proclaims that all human beings are born free and equal in dignity and rights and that 
everyone is entitled to all the rights and freedoms set forth therein, without distinction of any kind, including 
distinction based on sex,  

Noting that the States Parties to the International Covenants on Human Rights have the obligation to ensure 
the equal rights of men and women to enjoy all economic, social, cultural, civil and political rights,  

Considering the international conventions concluded under the auspices of the United Nations and the 
specialized agencies promoting equality of rights of men and women,  

Noting also the resolutions, declarations and recommendations adopted by the United Nations and the 
specialized agencies promoting equality of rights of men and women,  

Concerned, however, that despite these various instruments extensive discrimination against women 
continues to exist,  

Recalling that discrimination against women violates the principles of equality of rights and respect for 
human dignity, is an obstacle to the participation of women, on equal terms with men, in the political, social, 
economic and cultural life of their countries, hampers the growth of the prosperity of society and the family 
and makes more difficult the full development of the potentialities of women in the service of their countries 
and of humanity,  

Concerned that in situations of poverty women have the least access to food, health, education, training and 
opportunities for employment and other needs,  

Convinced that the establishment of the new international economic order based on equity and justice will 
contribute significantly towards the promotion of equality between men and women,  

Emphasizing that the eradication of apartheid, all forms of racism, racial discrimination, colonialism, neo-
colonialism, aggression, foreign occupation and domination and interference in the internal affairs of States 
is essential to the full enjoyment of the rights of men and women,  

Affirming that the strengthening of international peace and security, the relaxation of international tension, 
mutual co-operation among all States irrespective of their social and economic systems, general and 
complete disarmament, in particular nuclear disarmament under strict and effective international control, the 
affirmation of the principles of justice, equality and mutual benefit in relations among countries and the 
realization of the right of peoples under alien and colonial domination and foreign occupation to self-
determination and independence, as well as respect for national sovereignty and territorial integrity, will 
promote social progress and development and as a consequence will contribute to the attainment of full 
equality between men and women,  

Convinced that the full and complete development of a country, the welfare of the world and the cause of 
peace require the maximum participation of women on equal terms with men in all fields,  
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Bearing in mind the great contribution of women to the welfare of the family and to the development of 
society, so far not fully recognized, the social significance of maternity and the role of both parents in the 
family and in the upbringing of children, and aware that the role of women in procreation should not be a 
basis for discrimination but that the upbringing of children requires a sharing of responsibility between men 
and women and society as a whole,  

Aware that a change in the traditional role of men as well as the role of women in society and in the family is 
needed to achieve full equality between men and women,  

Determined to implement the principles set forth in the Declaration on the Elimination of Discrimination 
against Women and, for that purpose, to adopt the measures required for the elimination of such 
discrimination in all its forms and manifestations,  

Have agreed on the following:  

PART I  

Article I  

For the purposes of the present Convention, the term "discrimination against women" shall mean any 
distinction, exclusion or restriction made on the basis of sex which has the effect or purpose of impairing or 
nullifying the recognition, enjoyment or exercise by women, irrespective of their marital status, on a basis of 
equality of men and women, of human rights and fundamental freedoms in the political, economic, social, 
cultural, civil or any other field. 

Article 2  
States Parties condemn discrimination against women in all its forms, agree to pursue by all appropriate 
means and without delay a policy of eliminating discrimination against women and, to this end, undertake:  
(a) To embody the principle of the equality of men and women in their national constitutions or other 
appropriate legislation if not yet incorporated therein and to ensure, through law and other appropriate 
means, the practical realization of this principle;  

(b) To adopt appropriate legislative and other measures, including sanctions where appropriate, prohibiting 
all discrimination against women;  

(c) To establish legal protection of the rights of women on an equal basis with men and to ensure through 
competent national tribunals and other public institutions the effective protection of women against any act of 
discrimination;  

(d) To refrain from engaging in any act or practice of discrimination against women and to ensure that public 
authorities and institutions shall act in conformity with this obligation;  

(e) To take all appropriate measures to eliminate discrimination against women by any person, organization 
or enterprise;  

(f) To take all appropriate measures, including legislation, to modify or abolish existing laws, regulations, 
customs and practices which constitute discrimination against women;  

(g) To repeal all national penal provisions which constitute discrimination against women.  

Article 3  
States Parties shall take in all fields, in particular in the political, social, economic and cultural fields, all 
appropriate measures, including legislation, to en sure the full development and advancement of women , for 
the purpose of guaranteeing them the exercise and enjoyment of human rights and fundamental freedoms 
on a basis of equality with men. 
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